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Asia, has an insular climate. The northern part of China, and the

Atlantic region of the United States, exhibit " excessive climates."

We find at New York, says I-Iumboldt, the summer of Rome and the

winter of Copenhagen; at Quebec, the summer of Paris and the

winter of Petersburg. At Pekin, in China, where the mean temper-

ature of the year is that of the coasts of Brittany, the scorching heats

of summer are greater than at Cairo, and the winters as rigorous as

at Upsala.*
If lines be drawn round the globe through all those places which

have the same winter temperature, they are found to deviate from the

terrestrial parallels much farther than the lines of equal mean annual

heat. The lines of equal winter in Europe, for example, are often

curved so as to reach parallels of latitude 90 or 100 distant from

each other, whereas the isothermal lines, or those passing through

places having the same mean annual temperature, difThr only from 4°

to 50 in Europe.
influence qf currents and dr/'t ice on temperature. - Among

other influential causes, both of remarkable diversity in the mean

annual heat, and. of unequal division of heat in the different seasons,

are the direction of currents and the accumulation and drifting of ice

in high latitudes. The temperature of the Lagullas current is 10° or
12° Fahr. above that of the sea at the Cape of Good hope; for it

derives the greater part of its waters from the Mozambique channel,

and south-east coast of Africa, and from regions in the Indian Ocean

much nearer the line, and much hotter than the Cape.t An opposite
effect is produced by the "

equatorial" current, which crosses the
Atlantic from Africa to Brazil, having a breadth varying from 160 to
450 nautical miles. Its waters are cooler by 3° or 4° Fahr. than those
of the ocean under the line, so that it moderates the heat of the

tropics.
But the effects of the Gulf stream on the climate of the North

Atlantic Ocean are far more remarkable. This most powerful of
known currents has its source in the Gulf or Sea of Mexico, which,
like the Mediterranean and other close seas in temperate or low lati
tudes, is warmer than the open ocean in the same parallels. The
temperature of the Mexican sea in summer is, according to Rennell,
86° Fahr., or at least 7° above that of the Atlantic in the same lati
tude. From this great reservoir or caldron of warm water, a constant
current pours forth through the straits of Bahama at the rate of 3 or
4 miles an hour; it crosses the ocean in a north-easterly direction,
skirting the great bank of Newfoundland, where it still retains a
temperature of 8° above that of the surrounding sea. It reaches the
Azores in about 78 days, after flowing nearly 3000 geographical miles,
and from thence it sometimes extends its course a thousand miles
farther, so as to reach the Bay of Biscay, still retaining an excess of
5° above the mean temperature of that sea. As it has been known

* On Isothermal Lines, &c. Ibid. p. 15:3.
f Renndll on Currents, p. 96. London, § Ibid. p. 25.

1832.


	LinkTextBox: http://www.geology.19thcenturyscience.org/books/1850-Lyell-Principles/README.htm


